?ACARD'NAH Procurement Job Aid

Bid Processing

About Bid Processing

The bid process in Cardinal is designed and functions in the manner that Bidders can enter bids
online. At this time, this function has not been turned on. State agency procurement standards
and requirements have not changed. Therefore, event Versions are generally used to allow bid
tabulation staff to open and close events in order to enter bidders and the bid responses into
Cardinal, when appropriate.

Only users with the Bid Tabulator role enter bid responses into a Strategic Sourcing Event. In
Cardinal, bid tabulators have the ability to enter new or additional bidders, prior to posting.
Upon posting, the Event is locked and the clock begins to count down. Bid responses are
entered while the clock is ticking, or prior to Pending Award status. If a bid tabulation error is
made, Cardinal allows bid tabulators to make corrections or edits as necessary. After all bids
have been entered and only after the closing date/time, bid responses may be viewed and
analyzed.

* Navigate to Main Menu > Sourcing > Maintain Events > Event Workbench.

4 CARDINAL

Favn'rites Ma\n'Menu s Sourcing > Maintain Events : Event Workbench

Event Workbench
~ Search Criteria
Event ID: From Start Date: To Start Date: B sortwith: -
Created By: 9. From End Date: 5 To End Date: [ SortOrder: >
Event Format: 2 Category: [ ™ Only show Events | created
Event Type: iz ftem ID: [ ™ use my search defaults
Event Status: j' Description: [ Search . Reset
i . @, -
Associated With Plan: . Plan Name: [ % Default Search Preferences
b Legend

I 0000151126 Bulding/RoomReno..  Buy RFx 50100 [| Event Completed © EH
I 0000151125 test Buy Auction 50100 | Open © B
I 0000151118 Lawn & Landscape M Buy RFx 50100 | Open © B
I 0000151066 Utility Locating/M Buy RFx 50100 J Open © B
I 0000151119 Cold Mix Asphalt, Buy RFx 50100 [ Open © =
I 0000151109 Earthmoving Equipm..  Buy RFx 50100 [ Open o =
Ll " 0000151120 Bridge Maintenance Buy RFx 50100 JOpen o =

The Event status is displayed, where you can determine if able to enter bid responses. See listing below.

e Open: An event that has been saved but not posted or routed for collaboration; bids are not
allowed.

e Posted: An event that is approved; bidding is ongoing.

e Event Completed: An event that has ended but for which the Update Event status process has
not been run yet; bidding is ongoing.

e Pending Award: The Event is complete and the Update Event status has been run, but has not
yet been awarded; bids are not allowed.

e Collaborating Bid Analysis: An event that has been routed for internal collaboration on the
received bids.

e Awarded: An event that has been awarded and for which the status for all line items is Closed.

e Canceled: An event that was canceled by the event creator.
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Bid Processing

Create a New Event Version: Pages 2-6

Enter Bidder/Offeror Responses: Pages 7-12
Creating a Bid Summary Report: Pages 13-14
Printing a Bid Tabulation Report: Pages 15 - 16
Editing/Changing a Bid Response: Pages 17 - 19
Bid Tab Cheat Sheet: Pages 20 - 22

Create a New Event Version:

In this example, we are going to create a new version to add a new bidder.

1 Navigate to Main Menu > Sourcing > Maintain Events > Event Workbench.

Home | Workist | AddtoFavorites | Sign out
Favo'rrtes Main'Menu > SouLcmg > MainGirlEven': » Event Workbench
B New Window @He\p [-,/Custormze Page Entp El
Event Workbench
Event ID: From Start Date: [ To Start Date: B sort with: =
Created By: @ fromEndpate: | [5 ToEnd Date: [ sortorder: [ |
Event Format: —;I Category: [ ™ Only show Events | created
Event Type: = Item ID: [ ™ Use my search defaults
Event Status: :I' Description: [ | Search \ . Reset \
(TR . Plan Name: | @ Default Search Preferences
Event ID Name Format Type Unit Status
" 0000151126 BuildingRoomReno..  Buy RFx 50100 EventCompleted © mn |0 1=
" 0000151125 test Buy Auction 50100 Open Q 88
I pooo151118 Lawn & Landscape M..  Buy RFx 50100 Open (-] B2
P 0000151066 Utility Locating/M Buy RFx 50100 Open Qo o
I 0000151118 Cold Mix Asphalt, . Buy RFx 50100 Open (<] B
I pooo151109 Earthmoving Equipm Buy RFx 50100 Open Q B
Ll I 0000151120 Bridge Maintenance... Buy RFx 50100 Open [x] 5]

2 Click the Create New Version icon.

Create Mew Version? (18058,8129)

This operation will create a new version ofthe event. The current active

wersion will not be inactivated until the new version has been posted. Select
“es'ifyou wish to create a new wersion for this event. Otherwise, select No'

3 Click Yes to Create a New Version icon.
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¥ CARDINAL

Main'Menu » Sourcng > Maintain Events > Event Workbench

Favaorites

Home | workist | AddtoFavorites | Sign out

B New Window @He\p [/,Custom\zeF'age Hhtp =

Modify an Event

Event Summary
Business Unit: 50100  EventID: 0000151126 Round: 1 Version: 2 Event Format: Buy
Event Type: RFx Change to Auction
Event Status: Open Preview Date: 07252012 11:48AM EDT
*Solicitation Type : IlFB Sealed Contract j *Start Date: 07i25/2012 12:05PM EDT
*Event Name: |E|U\|dng'RUUm Renovation IEnd Date: 07/25/2013 4:50PM EDT I
Description: @ Copy From: j Go
Preview By: By Lot hd

bidders and bids.

4 Update the End Date to a Date and Time that will provide you with enough time to enter all of your

Step 4: Invite Collaborators
Invite others to collaborate on this event. You may not post your event while collaborators are reviewing it

Event Collaborators

Step 5: Post Event
When all event creation activities are complete, click Post Event to release your event for scheduled external viewing

and trigger any bidder invitations you may have defined.
Preview PDF

Save As Template

I Post I

I Save Event

Related Links:
Document Status Inquiry

€  LastUpdated By: HALL, MIKE 07/25/2013 03:47 PM EDT

Plan Task Associations

b Add

[ot Returnto Search | &% Refresh

Update/Display.

5

ltem Line Defaults

If no Bidders are to be added, click Save and Post to allow for bids to be entered.

*Line ltems

Step 3: Select Bidders to Invite

Send out targeted invitations to this event, designate it as a public event, or bath.

I * Bidder Invitations I

6 If Bidders are to be added, click on the Bidder Invitations hyperlink.
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Workiist |  Add to Favorites |
Favo'rrtes Main'Menu » Sourcng > Maintain Events > Event Workbench

& New Window @ Help [-,/ Customize Page E http
Medify an Event

Invite Bidders

Business Unit: 50100  EventID: 0000151126 Round: 1 Version: 2
™ Public Event
Bidder Invitation List

Event Format: Buy Event Type: RFx

Select  Bidder ID Bidder Type Location  Hame Renotify

1 [ |oooooooooz Vendor WAIN Land & Sealnc = 5] =
2| T 0000000013 Vendor WAIN Resource Systems Group Inc = 5] =
a [ |ooooooooas Vendor WAIN Hero Enterprises Inc = 5] =

Save Bidders as Group

I Save Event Changes
=Return to Event Overview

|2t Return to Search | | Refresh

|Eb-aAdd| | Updaterisplay.

7 Click the Search for Bidders hyperlink.

| workist | AddtoFavorites |  Sign out
Favovrrtes MalnvMeﬂu » Sourcing > Maintain Events » Event Workbench

@New‘.’\'mduw @He\p BCUSIUm\ZﬂPage Ehnp
Bidder Search

Search Criteria

Bidder Type: Vendor j'

Name: KBS Inc @ State: [ Type: [|
D: [ N City: s [ R
Contact: ’70‘ Country: ’—Q\ SIC Code: @
Group ID: ,70\ Postal: ’7 ftem ID: @

Group Name: Oﬁ

Results Option: |Di5play Bidder/Company Id Only j

Type: il
I Search ] I Recommend Bidders \ Maximum Rows retrieved: 50

Enter search criteria and press search to retrieve bidders.

| OK | Cancel | Refresh |

8 Enter Search Criteria and click Search.
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Add to Favorites | Sign out

Favovrrtes MalnvMeﬂu > SouLcmg > MamlzulEveﬂG » Event Workbench
2 New Window @He\p E{“Custom\zePage Ehnp

Bidder Search

Search Criteria
Bidder Type: Vendor j'

Name: KES Inc @ State: [ Type: |
1D: ,7(35 City: ’7 SIC Type: 2
Contact: ’70\ Country: ’—O‘h SIC Code: 2
Group ID: ,7()% Postal: ’7 Item ID: 2

Group Name: @

Results Option: | Display Bidder/Company Id Only j Type: I hd
| Search | | Recommend Bidders Maximum Rows retrieved: 50
Select All Deselect All

Search Results 10f1 0 Last

Bidder ID Location Bidder Company
1/0000036222 WAIN @, KBSInc

! ICarlcei || Refresh |

9 Check the Invite box for the vendor(s) you would like to choose and click OK.

Favo'rrtes Main'Menu » Sourcng > Maintain Events > Event Workbench

& New Window @ Help [-,/ Customize Page E http
Medify an Event

Invite Bidders

Business Unit: 50100 Event ID: 0000151126 Round: 1 Version: 2 Event Format: Buy Event Type: RFx

™ Public Event
Bidder Invitation List

First K 14074

Select  Bidder ID Bidder Type Location  Hame Renotify
1 [ |oooooooooz Vendor WAIN Land & Sealnc = 5] =
2| [T 0000000013 Vendor WAIN Resource Systems Group Inc = 5] =
a [ |ooooooooas Vendor WAIN Hero Enterprises Inc = 5] =
4 [T |oooooaszzz Vendor WAIN KBS Inc 5] =
Search for Bidders Save Bidders as Group

| Save Event Changes ot | = | Go

|2t Return to Search | |7 Refresh

10 Bidders are displayed. Click Return to Event Overview.
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Step 4: Invite Collaborators

Invite others to collaborate on this event. You may not post your event while collaborators are reviewing it.
Event Collaborators

Step 5: Post Event

When all event creation activities are complete, click Post Event to release your event for scheduled external viewing
and trigger any bidder invitations you may have defined.

T 1 N
I| Save Event I\ Post I\ | Save As Template | | Preview PDF |

Related Links:

Document Status Inquiry Plan Task Associations
€@  LastUpdated By: HALL MIKE 07/25/2013 03:47 PM EDT

|2t Returnto Search | £ Refresh | |Ew-aAdd| [JE - Updaterisplay

11 Click Save Event and Click Post.

This will submit the Event for Approval. (18058,207)

Once the eventis approved and posted you will be limited to the changes that

you can make to the event. Click OK to continue or Cancel ifyou are not done

making changes to the event.

12 A message appears. Click the OK button to submit the event for approval.

Page 6 of 22

Last Updated 3/11/2014




, CARDINAL

Procurement Job Aid
Bid Processing

Enter Bidder/Offeror Responses:

13 Navigate to: Main Menu > Sourcing > Event Responses > Create Bidder Response.

Create Bidder Response

Use Saved Search: d Save . Delete | Clear

Search Criteria

*Business Unit: 50100 |@, Bidder Type: l—;[
EventID: 0000151127 Bidder Setid:

Event Format: - Bidder ID:
Event Type: | Name: I—
Event Hame: [ @, Contact Name: — Search

Customize | Find | B First Kl 14014 I | ast
Event ID Event Hame Round Version Name Bidder Type Setid Bidder ID Location

Road Improvements-Bristol &

50100-0000151127 I Salem 1 1 Land & Sea Inc Vendor STATE 0000000002 MAIN

Road Improvements-Bristol & Resource Systems Group

50100-0000151127 | Gt 1 1 e Vendor STATE 0000000013 MAIN
50100-0000151127 ;{ggﬂr:mpm\'emems’ansmla 1 1 Hero Enterprises Inc Vendor STATE 0000000034 MAIN
50100-0000151127 ;tg;%mpmvemems—anstm& 1 1 KBS Inc Vendor STATE 0000036222 MAIN

14 The Create Bidder Response page appears.

15 Click the Event ID link for the vendor and event you are entering for an offeror response.

Enter Bid on Behalf of Land & Sea Inc I
Bidder Setid: STATE BidderID: 0000000002 Bidder Location: MAIN
Event Def customize | B First £ 15016 1 Laat
Business Unit  Event 1D Event Round Event Version bme Item Description
umber
CONSTRUCTION, HIGHWAY AND ROAD
20200 CesbafEr |E L L CONSTRUCTION, HIGHWAY AND ROAD
CONSTRUCTION, HIGHWAY AND ROAD
50100 0000151127 |1 ! 2 CONSTRUCTION, HIGHWAY AND ROAD
CONSTRUCTION, HIGHWAY AND ROAD
50100 0000151127 |1 ! 3 GONSTRUGTION, HIGHWAY AND ROAD
CONSTRUCTION, HIGHWAY AND ROAD
50100 oo000151127 1 ! 4 CONSTRUCTION, HIGHWAY AND RO2D
50100 0000151127 1 1 5 Bristol District
50100 0000151127 1 1 6 Salem District
Enter a New Eid ) [ Download XL Bid Packet
Accept Invitation Click Accept Invitation if you intend to respond to this RFx at a later time.
Decline Invitation Click Decline Invitation if you do notintend to respond to this RFx
Return to Create Bidder Response

16 Enter Bid on Behalf of vendor name is displayed.

17 Click the Enter a New Bid button.

T TER IO TR e T

Defaultthe bid gquantity for each line item to be equal to the requested quantity? (18058,4118)

Select Yes' if you would like to have the bid quantity for auction line items defaulted for you. You will be allowed to change the line item bid quantity at any point prior to submitting your bid. Select ‘Mo’ if you do not wish to have the
bid quantity defaulted

One important note: If you select to default the bid quantity, only non-group lines will be impacted by this option. This is because responses for individual line items must be complete before bids can be placed for any line

Yes I Mo

18 Click Yes button.
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Worklist Add to Favorites.

Favo'rrtes M 'Menu » Sourcng > EventResponses > Create Bidder Response
& New Window @He\p E,)CustormzeF'age Ehnp =

Welcome, MIKE HALL

Event Details User. MIKE HALL
Submit Bid J Save for Later | I Validate Entries

Event Name: Road Improvements-Bristol & Salem Bidding Instructions
Event ID: 50100-0000151127 Bid 1D: New
Event Format/Type: Sell Event RFx Bid Date:
Event Round: 1 Bid Currency: USD| us Dollar
Event Version: 1
Event Start Date: 07/26/2013 9:22AM EDT
Event End Date: Ohrs, Smins, 4 secs

Viewl/Add General Comments and Altachments

Hide Additional Event Infa

Description:
[ (E]
Contact: HALL, MIKE Payment Terms:
Phone: Billing Location: Central Office Old Bldg
Email: xommike hall@vdotvirginia.gov Event Currency: Dollar
Online Discussion: Conversion Rate: 1.00000000
Edits to Submitted Bids: Allowed
Multiple Bids: Mot Allowed

Step 1: Enter Line Bid Responses

This event contains one or more individual lines that await your bid response. Some or all lines may require your bid in order for consideration by the

Lines in This Event: 4
Lines Responded To: 0
Your Total Line Pricing: 0.0000 USD

Hide Line Detail

Customize | Find | View Al B | 2 First K1 124 or4 I3 L ast
, -  Requested  Your Bid ) __ YourCurrent Your UnitBid Your Total Bid :
Line  Deseription Unit e Unit Start Price | L0 e bl Ho Bid

CONSTRUCTION, HIGHWAY
AND ROAD

1 CONSTRUCTION, HIGHWAY EA 1.0000 1.0000 0.0000 USD I~ |Bid
AND ROAD
CONSTRUCTION, HIGHWAY
AND ROAD

2 CONSTRUCTION, HIGHWAY EA 1.0000 1.0000 0.0000 USD r |Bd
AND ROAD
CONSTRUCTION, HIGHWAY
AND ROAD

3y CONSTRUCTION, HIGHWAY EA 1.0000 1.0000 0.0000 USD I~ |Bid
AND ROAD
CONSTRUCTION, HIGHWAY
AND ROAD

4 CONSTRUCTION, HIGHWAY EA 1.0000 1.0000 0.0000 USD r |Bd

AND ROAD

Lines may have been grouped to satisfy a specific requirement. If you have already entered individual line responses, you are ready to consider if you can offer more

Line Groups in This Event: 2' Groups Responded To: 0 Display Group Detail

Atany pointin the bid response process you may save an in-progress bid and resume completion at later time. When your bid response is complete, submit for
consideration.

Submit Bid ) Save for Later ) Validate Entries

Return to Create Bidder Response

19 The Event Details page appears.

Note: This page identifies the required responses to include bid factors and the amount of lines and
groups (as applicable).
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Fa\m'ntes Maln'Menu » Sourcng > Event Responses > Create Bidder Response
Edits to Submitted Bids: Allowed
Multiple Bids: Mot Allowed

Step 1: Enter Line Bid Responses

This event contains one or more individual lines that await your bid response. Some or all lines may require your bid in order for consideration by the
Event Administrator.
Lines in This Event: 4

Lines Responded To: 0

Your Total Line Pricing: 22,050.0000 USD

Hide Line Detail

Customize | Find | |

Requested Your Bid ~ N Your Current Your Unit Bid . N .
Quantity Quantity Unit Start Price Price Price Your Total Bid Price  No Bid

Line Description Unit
CONSTRUCTION, HIGHWAY
ANDROND, EA 1.0000 1.0000 3555.00000083555.000001 3,555.0000 USD I Bid
CONSTRUCTION, HIGHWAY g Bid

AND ROAD

CONSTRUCTION, HIGHWAY
AND ROAD
CONSTRUCTION, HIGHWAY EA 1.0000 1.0000 5545.00000085545.0000014 5,545.0000 USD r Bid

AND ROAD

CONSTRUCTION, HIGHWAY
3 ADROND EA 1.0000 1.0000 5450.00000085450.000001f  5,450.0000 USD [ Bid
CONSTRUCTION, HIGHWAY : el

AND ROAD

CONSTRUCTION, HIGHWAY
AND ROAD
4 CONSTRUCTION, HIGHWAY EA 1.0000 1.0000 7500.00000087500.0000014 7,500.0000 USD r

AND ROAD

=
=

Step 2: Enter Line Group Bid Response

Lines may have been grouped to satisfy a specific requirement. If you have already entered individual line responses, you are ready to consider if you can offer more
favorable terms for lines awarded in groups.

Line Groups in This Event: 2 Groups Responded To: 0 Display Group Detail

At any pointin the bid response process you may save an in-progress bid and resume completion at later time. When your bid response is complete, submit for
consideration.

| Submit Bid | Saweforlater | Validate Entries

Return to Create Bidder Response

Bid Processing

Worklist Add to Favorites Sign ouf

20 Enter the bid responses.

21 If Line Groups are shown, click on the Display Group Detail hyperlink.

Step 2: Enter Line Group Bid Response

Lines may have been grouped to satisfy a specific requirement. If you have already entered individual line responses, you are ready to consider if you can offer more
favorable terms for lines awarded in groups.

Line Groups in This Event: 2 Groups Responded To: 0 Hide Group Detail

Customize | Find | View &
Requested  Your Bid Unit Start Your Current Your UnitBid  Your Total Bid

f== i Unit | ouantity Quanti Price Price == Price Lo
5 Bristol District 10 1000010000 0.0000 USD r
6|5alem District 10 10000 10000 0.0000 USD r e

22 Enter The Bid Quantity of 1.
23 Click on the Bid hyperlink.
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Item Description: Response Required: No I™ No Bid
Bristol District &}

ViewiAdd Question Comments and Altachments

Unit of Measure: I Group Your Unit Bid Pri 9100.000000 I
g 9100.000000

Qty Requested: 1.0000 !

Your Max Bid Quantity: 1.0000 Bid Increment:
Total Bid Price: 9,100.0000 USD
Reserve Price: No

h:‘r‘:ber Description uom a:.‘;::w Start Price Your Unit Bid Price gifossa"“w""
CUTUCTON G AORI0 oo oo wsmoom 1o
DRI MO0 | omo  couon| mewows 1w
Total Detail Price: 9,100.0000 USD
‘Save for Later alidate Entries
Group: q10f 2 Go To Group: | j Previous Group Mext Group

24 Group/Lot values automatically populate and total. Note: Group bid prices display the sum of each
unit price combined, not the extended prices. This is expected. The total extended pricing will be
displayed on the bid tabulation report.

25 Click on Start Page button.

COS TRUC TTOT, FTGHTVAT
AND ROAD

CONSTRUCTION, HIGHWAY EA 1.0000 1.0000 3555.000000|3555.00000( | 3,555.0000 USD r  Bid
AND ROAD
CONSTRUCTION, HIGHWAY
AND ROAD

2 CONSTRUCTION, HIGHWAY EA 1.0000 1.0000 5545.000000|5545.00000( 55450000 USD I~ Bid
AND ROAD
CONSTRUCTION, HIGHWAY
POIDFISEY EA 1.0000 1.0000 5450.000000||5450.000001 | 5,450.0000 USD I Bid
CONSTRUCTION, HIGHWAY ™~ : ' =
AND ROAD
CONSTRUCTION, HIGHWAY
AND ROAD

4 CONSTRUCTION, HIGHWAY EA 1.0000 1.0000 7500.000000|[7500.00000( |7,500.0000 USD I~ Bid
AND ROAD

Step 2: Enter Line Group Bid Response
Lines may have been grouped to satisfy a specific requirement. If you have already entered individual line responses, you are ready to consider if you can offer more
favorable terms for lines awarded in groups

Line Groups in This Event: 2 Groups Responded To: 2 Hide Group Detail
Customize | Find | View A1 ] B First KX 1-2 of 2 I3 L ast
e e Unit Requested Your Bid Unit Start Your Current  Your Unit Bid Your Total Bid No Bid
P Quantity Quantity Price Price Price Price
5 Bristol District 10 1.0000 1.0000 9100.000000|| 9100.000000, 9,100.0000 USD I |Bid
6|Salem District 10 1.0000 1.0000 12950.000000|12950.000000 12,950.0000 USD ~ id

At any point in the bid response process you may save an in-progress bid and resume completion at later time. When your bid response is complete, submit for
consideration.

Submit Bid J Save for Later

26 Repeat steps 20 through 23 for the next Group.
27 Click on Validate Entries button.
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Ma errors faund. ¢18058,313)

28 Click OK. Note: If errors occur, a message will be displayed at the top of the page (in red) with
specific instructions.

Step 2: Enter Line Group Bid Response

Lines may have been grouped to satisfy a specific requirement If you have already entered individual line responses, you are ready to consider if you can offer more
favorable terms for lines awarded in groups.
Line Groups in This Event: 2 Groups Responded To: 2 Display Group Detail

Atany pointin the bid response process you may save an in-progress bid and resume completion at later time. When your bid response is complete, submit for
consideration

| SubmitBid || sawforiater | Vvalidate Entries

Return to Create Bidder Response

29 Click Submit Bid button.

| workist | Addto Favorites.

Favo'rrtes Main'Menu » Sourcng > EventResponses > Create Bidder Response
& New Window @He\p [-,/CustormzeF'age Ehnp

Bid Confirmation

Your bid has been successfully submitted

Bid ID: 1 Bid Date: 07/26/2013 9:32:20AM EDT

Event ID: 0000151127 Road Improvements-Bristol & Salem

Event Format: Sell Event Round: 1 Version: 1
Start Date: 07/26/2013 9:22AM EDT End Date: 0 hrs, 12 mins, 11 secs

Your Total Price: 22050.00USD

30 Click OK.
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4 CARDINAL

Home | Workist | AddtoFavorites |  Sign out
Favovrrtes MalnvMeﬂu » Sourcing > Event Responses > Create Bidder Response

@New‘.’\'mduw @He\p [-,)Cusmm\ze Page E hitp
Create Bidder Response

Use Saved Search: s Save | Delete | Clear
*Business Unit: WQ Bidder Type: lﬁ
Event ID: [ooo0151127 | Bidder Setid: -
Event Format: l—;[ Bidder ID: l—
Event Type: [ = Name: -
Event Hame: [ @, Contact Hame: l— Search

w

Search Results Customize | Find | B |

First Kl 1404 O3 Last
Event ID Event Name Round Version Name Bidder Type Setid Bidder ID Location

Road Improvements-Bristol &

50100-0000151127 Salem

1 1 Land & Sea Inc Vendor STATE 0000000002 MAIN

50100-0000151127 g;;‘:r:mpmvemems’ansml& 1 1 :?;50”"39 Systems Group | ooy STATE 0000000013 MAIN

Road Improvements-Bristol &

50100-0000151127 Salem

1 1 Hero Enterprises Inc Vendor STATE 0000000034 MAIN

Road Improvements-Bristol &

50100-0000151127 Salem

1 1 KBS Inc Vendor STATE 0000036222 MAIN

o4 Refresh

31 The Create Bidder Response page is returned.
32 Click on the next bidder hyperlink from the list and repeat steps 17 through 29.

33 Repeat the same steps for all remaining bidders to complete the bid tabulation process.
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Creating a Bid Summary Report:

34 Navigate to Sourcing > Maintain Events > Analyze Events

35 Enter your Event ID to open the Analyze Total page. Note: you may view the Event Total, Line or
Group.

| workist | AddtoFavorites |  Sign out
Favuvrrtes MEII‘IvMEﬂu » Sourcing > Maintain Events > Analyze Events
|_E| New Window @ Help E»,/ Customize Page E http

Analyze Total
Analyze Total Analyze Line l\na\gﬁ Groug I
Business Unit: Event ID: Round: Version: Event Name:
50100 0000151127 1 1 Road Improvements-Bristol & Salem
Event Format: Event Type: Currency: End Date: Status: IGoTo: I
Buy RFx usD 07/26/2013 9:45AM EDT Pending Award _'I
» Bid Analysis and Display Options
Analysis
Bidder Name Resource Systems Group ero Enterprises Inc Land & Sealni

Inc

o Create New Round
Event Version Responded To: 9 1 1 Document Status Inquiry
Bid Number: 1 Q 1 1 Q Event Attachments/Comments
Total Bid Amount: 62,011.0000 22,145.0000 22,050.0000
Total Bid Cost 0.00 0.00 000 0.00
Total Event Score: 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000
Total Header Cost 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Total Header Score: 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000
Bid Action [rm =l [na | [na | [na [~
Reject Reason: @, [ @ [ @ [ @
Award by Percent: \ | |
Hide Bid - r r r

Recalculate | Add/EditFactors Unhide Bids < = > .
Save | [oh Return to Search
Analyze Total | Analyze Line | Analyze Group

36 Click on Analyze Export within the Go To panel.

Bid Analysis Export

Business Unit: Event ID: Round: Version: Event Name:

50100 0000151127 1 1 Road Improvements-Bristol & Salem

Event Format: Event Type: Currency: Finish: Status:

Buy RFx uso 07/26/13 9:45AM EDT Pending Award

Analysis Export File Recipients Custo First K1 1011 1 oot (£

*Name *Email Address Notify =

1 |lv”KE HALL Q |)ocoocoocow:\@\tdulu|rg|ma.gw ~

Filter Bids

Selectthe bids you want to include in your Analysis Export file

Select All DeselectAll
¥ Award ¥ Counter ¥ Disallow ¥ Reject ¥ <No Action>
¥ Display Disqualified Bids ¥ Display Withdrawn Bids

Filter Bid Responses

™ Display Delta Responses

I S e I Retumn to Analyze Event

To create a bid analysis export
1. Enter the email addresses of these you would like to receive the export.

o 2. Click on the Create Analysis Export button. At this pointthe Analyze Events pages will be saved,
and a process will be kicked off to create the Bid Analysis Export file and email the recipients listed
above.

3. Once the email is received, open the XML attachment in Microsoft Excel

Save | [Gh Return to Search

37 Select/Add names that you wish to send a report.

38 Click on the Create Analysis Export button.
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From: Sent:  Fri7/26/2013 1:03 PM
To: # Hall, Mike (vDOT)

CcC

Subject: Event Analysis Export Motification

b4 Messagell 2 Bid_Analysis_Export.xm| 336 KB]I

Event Analysis Export

The event analysis for the following event has been exported into XML format and is attached below.

Event Details

Event ID: 50100-0000151127 Round 1 Version 1
Event Name: Road Improvements-Bristol & Salem
Description:

1. Please detach the XML file and save it to a location on your hard drive.
2 Use Microsoft Excel or equivalent spreadsheet software to open the file
3. Be sure to save the file once changes have been made.

39 Email is sent to the selected names.

40 Click on Attachment file.

i

&3] Bid_Analysis_Export1127.ml

Event Analysis

PeopleSoft Strategic Sourcing Report Date: 07/26i2013 0102 PMEDT
Everc ID Format Type  Round  Wersion Event Currency: LIS Dallar
S0100-000015 127 Buy RFs 1 1 Bids Allowed in Other Currency: Mo

Event Name Factor General Score into Line Score: Mo

Fioad Impravements-Eristol & Salem

Start Time Finish Time Included Bids: Al
O7/26/2013 03:22 AMEDT 0712612013 03:45 &M EOT Highlight Delta Response: ho
Group Details
Bidder Name: Land & Sealne szource Systems Group It Hero Enterprizes Inc KES Ine
Event Version: 1 1 1 1
Bid Number: 1 1 1 1
Line: 5 Group ID: LOT1 Requested Guy: 1 UOM: 10 Group Bid Quantity 1 1 1 0
Bid Required: Nlo  Reserve Price: No “otal Group Bid Amount| 3100 50912 W7z 0
Description: Briztal District Total Group Score 00 i) avav a

Group Line Details

Line: 1 Iem ID: 3132701000 Line Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Quy per Group: 1
Item Description: COMSTRUCTION, HIGH' &Y AND ROAD CONSTRUCTION, HIGH &Y AMD ROAD

Line: 2 Iem ID: 3132707000 Line Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Qty per Group: 1
Item Deseription: COMSTRUCTION, HIGHW A AND ROAD CONSTRUCTION, HIGHW &Y AMD ROAD

Group Questions uoM Best Worst Weighting
What is your bid price? 100,00 Unit Bid Price: 9100 50912 14172 0
Score: 00 ] I ]
Line - 1 COMSTRUCTION, HIGHWAY D ROAD CONSTRUCTION, HIGHWAY AND ROAD
LU N nnnes Voo Bbid D[ acco T Ca75 T L) T n 1
M4 M I General Details Line Detals | Group Details -~ Terms & Conditions I Event Formulas - Do Not Change 2 AN I

Ready

41 Open file using Microsoft Excel, per the Cardinal directions. Note: The spreadsheet provides General

Details, Line Details, Group Details and the Event Terms and Conditions.
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Bid Processing

Printing a Bid Tabulation Report:

42 Navigate to: Sourcing > Reports > Event Bid Tab

|4 CARDINAL
— Home | Workist | AddtoFavorites |  Sign out

Favovrrtes MalnvMeﬂu > SouLcmg > Rep'orts » Event Bid Tab

Event Bid Tab

Event Bid Tab Report

@New‘.’\'mduw @He\p BCUSIUm\ZﬂPage Ehnp

Run Control ID:  BID_TAB Report Manager Process Monitor|
+*Business Unit 30100 X WA Dept of Transportation

EventID (0000151127 @

|[F) save | |2f Retumto Search | =] Previousin List | J5] Nextinlist | |[Z] Molify | |k Add| | Update/Display

43 Enter Event ID and click Run button.

. CARDINAL
= Home | workist | AddtoFavorites | Sign out

Favo'ntes Main'Menu » Sourcng > Reports > Event Bid Tab
& New Window @He\p [-,/CustormzeF'age Ehnp

View Log/Trace
ReportiD: 5129068 Process Instance: 1339484 Message Log
Name: VRPRO0S Process Type: Crystal

Run Status: Success

VRPRO03
Distribution Details

Distribution Node: finsit Expiration Date: 081252013

File List

File Size (bytes) Datetime Created

Hame
BW VEPR00Z 133045410 07/26/2013 1:38:04 552417PM EDT
48,213 07/26/2013 1:38.04.552417PM EDT
- 514 07/26/2013 1-38:04 552417PM EDT

ekt

Distribute To

Distribution ID Type *Distribution ID
User PPS_MIKE HALL

| Return |

44 Click on PDF file from the View Log/Trace page.
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=
Commonwealth of Virginia
- Department of Transportation
i BID TABULATION REPORT
4 Run Date: 0702612013
CARDIRAL
Run Time: 1:33 FM
L__ScoortlD VEER0E
Business Unit: 50100
Event ID: 0000151127
Page No. 10f2
Buyer HALL, MIKE Closing Date:  7/26/2013
Closing Time: 12:00:00 AM
Price
Vendor ID Vendor SWAM Type Group / Line# | Item ltem Deseription Quantity Unit Price Extended Awarded
Line Typ
Group: LOT 1
0000000002 Land & Sea Inc 5 Bristol Diswict 100 ©,100.00
0000000012 Resource Systems Group Inc Small Business 5 Bristol Diswict 100 50.812.00
0000000034 Hero Enterprises Inc 5 Bristol Diswict 100 14,172.00
0000036222 KBS Inc Small Business 5 Bristol Diswict
Group: LOT 2
0000000002 Land & Sea Inc 5 Salem District 100 12,850.00
0000000012 Resource Systems Group Inc Small Business 5 Salem District 100 11,082.00
0000000034 Hero Enterprises In ] Salem District 100 7.872.00
0000036222 KBS Inc Small Business ] Salem District 100 11.954.00
PageNo.  20f2
Buyer. HALL, MIKE Closing Date:  7/26/2013
Closing Time:  1200:00 AM
Price
Vendor ID Vendor SWAM Type Group / Line# | Item ltem Description Quantity Unit Price Extended Awarded
Line Typ
0000000002 Land & Sea Inc
5 1-0132701000  CONSTRUCTION, HIGHWAY AND R 100 2555.00 355500
5 20132701000  CONSTRUCTION, HIGHWAY AND R 100 £545.00 554500
Total : 9.100.00
& 30132701000 CONSTRUCTION, HIGHWAY AND R 100 £.450.00 5.450.00
& 40132701000 CONSTRUCTION, HIGHWAY AND R 100 7.500.00 7.500.00
Total : 12350.00
0000000013 Resaurce Systems Group Inc Small Business
5 1-9132701000 CONSTRUCTION, HIGHWAY AND R 5475.00 5475.00
5 20132701000 CONSTRUCTION, HIGHWAY AND R 45.437.00 45.437.00
50312.00
& 30132701000 CONSTRUCTION, HIGHWAY AND R 7.843.00 7.843.00
& 40132701000 CONSTRUCTION, HIGHWAY AND R 3.456.00 3.456.00
11,089.00
0000000034 Hero Enterprises Inc
§  1-9132701000 CONSTRUCTION, HIGHWAY AND R 100 £.538.00 6.538.00
§ 20132701000 CONSTRUCTION, HIGHWAY AND R 100 7.834.00 7.834.00
Total : 1447200
B 30132701000 CONSTRUCTION, HIGHWAY AND R 100 452300 452300
B 40132701000 CONSTRUCTION, HIGHWAY AND R 100 3.450.00 3,450.00
Total : 7.973.00
0000026222 KBS Inc Small Business
5 1-9132701000  CONSTRUCTION, HIGHWAY AND R
5 20132701000 CONSTRUCTION, HIGHWAY AND R
& 30132701000 CONSTRUCTION, HIGHWAY AND R 100 £454.00 5,454.00
6 49132701000 CONSTRUCTION, HIGHWAY AND R 100 £,500.00 ,500.00
Total : 11.954.00
End of Report

45 Bid Tabulation Report is displayed as shown.
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Bid Processing

Editing/Changing a Bid Response:

Note: Allow Edit of Posted Bids must be checked on the Sourcing Event in order to edit or change bid
responses.

Home | Workist | AddtoFavorites | Sign out
Favo'rrtes Main'Menu > Sourcing > Create Events :> Event Detzils

& New Window @ Help E,) Customize Page E http
Create an Event

Event Settings and Options

Business Unit: 50100 EventID: NEXT Round: 1 Version: 1 Event Format: Buy Event Type: RFx

™ Allow Bidder XML Dovmioads
I™ Bid Required On Al Lines

I¥ Sealed Event
I™ Display Bid Factor Weightings
I ¥ Allow Edit of Posted B\dsl play anting

Round\Version Display: |Di5p|ay Round and Version j

Factor Event Score Into: Total Score 7 Start Price: |Dn Not Display j
Header Weighting: 100.00000

Line Factor Weighting:

™ Bidders May Create Line Groups
I~ Allow Price Breaks with Groups

46 Navigate to: Main Menu > Sourcing > Event Responses > Create Bidder Response.

Home | Workist | AddtoFavorites | Sign out
Favuvrrtes MEII‘IvMEﬂu » Sourcng > Event Responses > Creste Bidder Response

@Nemedow @He\p E,/Cusmm\ze Page E http
Create Bidder Response

Use Saved Search: il Save Delete Clear
Search Criteria
*Business Unit: 50100 @, Bidder Type: lﬁ
Event ID: 0000151127 Bidder Setid:

Event Format: 2 Bidder ID:
Event Type: | Name: I—
Event Hame: [ @, Ccontact Name:

Search Results

Customize | Find | B | %8 rrst B g g 014 O Lot

Event ID Event Hame Round Version Name Bidder Type Setid Bidder ID

Location
50100-0000151127 g;g‘:r:mpmvememﬂ”m'& 1 1 Land & Sea Inc Vendor STATE 0000000002 MAIN
50100-0000151127  KoaoImerovements Bristol & 1 Resource Systems GIOUD yrengor STATE 0000000013 MAIN

50100-0000151127 gj;‘:r:mpm"emms'a"sm'& 1 1 Hera Enterprises Inc Vendor STATE 0000000034 MAIN

50100-0000151127 ?g;‘:r:mpm"emems'a"sm'& 1 1 Kas Inc Vendor STATE 0000036222 MAIN

o4 Refresh

47 The Create Bidder Response page appears.
48 Enter the Event ID and click Search

49 Click the Event ID link for the vendor that you want to edit.
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Bid Processing

Add to Favorites |

Favo'rrtes Main'Menu > Sourv.:\ng > Event Rgsponsas » Create Bidder Response
2 New Window @He\p @Custum\zel’age hnp
Enter Bid on Behalf of KBS Inc

Bidder Setid: STATE Bidder ID: 0000036222 Bidder Location: MAIN
Event Details customize | B! First T 16016 1 Last
Business Unit  Event 1D EventRound  EventVersion " ltem Description
Number

CONSTRUCTION, HIGHWAY AND ROAD
hILE Gl | L L CONSTRUCTION, HIGHWAY AND ROAD

CONSTRUCTION, HIGHWAY AND ROAD
50100 0000151127 |1 ! 2 CONSTRUCTION, HIGHWAY AND ROAD

CONSTRUGTION, HIGHWAY AND ROAD
50100 0000151127 |1 ! 3 GONSTRUGTION, HIGHWAY AND ROAD

CONSTRUCTION, HIGHWAY AND ROAD
50100 dooois11zr - ! 4 CONSTRUCTION, HIGHWAY AND ROAD
50100 0000151127 1 1 5 Bristol District
50100 0000151127 |1 1 ] Salem District

| Download XML Bid Packet |
~ Legend
¥ Cancel Bid # Editview existing Bid {FUpload Bid
First K1 1 or 1 I Last
Business Unit  EventID Event il Bid ID Date Time Last Saved
Round  Version

50100 0000151127 1 1 1 osted 07/26/2013 9:42AM EDT

Return to Create Bidder Response

50 Click the Edit/View existing Bid icon.

Favtyrtes M 'Menu » Sourcng > Event Responses » Create Bidder Response
Edits to Submitted Bids: Allowed ;l

Multiple Bids: Mot Allowed

Step 1: Enter Line Bid Responses

This event contains one or more individual lines that await your bid response. Some or all lines may require your bid in order for consideration by the
Event Administrator.

Lines in This Event: 4
Lines Responded To: 4
Your Total Line Pricing: 11,954.0000 USD

Hide Line Detail

Customize | Find

Requested Your Bid ~ N Your Current Your Unit Bid . N .
Quantity Quantity Unit Start Price Price Price Your Total Bid Price  No Bid

Line Description Unit

CONSTRUCTION, HIGHWAY

1 L) EA 1.0000 0.0000 USD I Bid
CONSTRUCTION, HIGHWAY -
AND ROAD
CONSTRUCTION, HIGHWAY

AND ROAD
2/ CONSTRUCTION, HiGHWaY B2 1.0000 0.0000 USD ¥ EBid
AND ROAD

CONSTRUCTION, HIGHWAY
AND ROAD EA
CONSTRUCTION, HIGHWAY
AND ROAD

1.0000 1.0000 5454.000000||5454.000001  5,454.0000 USD I~ Bid

CONSTRUCTION, HIGHWAY

AND ROAD
4 CONSTRUCTION, HIGHWAY EA 1.0000 1.0000 6500.000000||6500.000001 |6,500.0000 USD r

AND ROAD

=
=

Step 2: Enter Line Group Bid Response

Lines may have been grouped to satisfy a specific requirement. If you have already entered individual line responses, you are ready to consider if you can offer more
favorable terms for lines awarded in groups
Line Groups in This Event: 2 Groups Responded To: 2 Display Group Detail

Atany pointin the bid response process you may save an in-progress bid and resume completion at later time. When your bid response is complete, submit for
consideration

Submit Bid | saeforiaer | validate Entries

Return to Create Bidder Response

51 The previously entered bid is displayed and available for edit.

52 Enter changes and click on Submit Bid button.
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Event Completed. Are you sure you want to enter a hid? (18058 359)

e

Note: If the Event status has changed to Event Completed, this message is displayed.

53 Click Yes.

¢% CARDINAL |

Favovrrtes MalnvMeﬂu > SouLcmg > Event Rgsponses » Create Bidder Response

Home | Workist | AddtoFavorites | Sign out

@New‘.’\'mduw @He\p [éfcusmm\zeljage Ehnp
Bid Confirmation

Your bid has been successfully submitted.

Bid ID: 1 Bid Date: 08/071/2013 11:51:05AM EDT
Event ID: 0000151127 Road Improvements-Bristol & Salem

Event Format: Sell Event Round: 1 Version: 1
Start Date: 07/26/2013 9:22AM EDT End Date: Event Completed

Your Total Price: 11,953.00 USD

54 Click OK.

4P CARDINAL

Home | orkist | AddtoFavorites | Signout
Fa\m'ntes Main'Menu » Sourcng > EventResponses > Create Bidder Response

& New Window @He\p [/[Custormze Page =] http
Create Bidder Response

Use Saved Search: [ | | sae | | Delete | Clear

*Business Unit: WQ; Bidder Type: l—;[

EventID: [oo00151127 | Bidder Setid: I

Event Format: = Bidder ID: —

Event Type: l—;[ Name: I— )
Event Name: [ @, Contact Name: - | search

Search Results

First Kl 14 of 4 0 Last

Event ID Event Hame Round Version Name Bidder Type i Bidder ID Location

Road Improvements-Bristol &

50100-0000151127 Salem 1 1 Land & Sea Inc Vendor STATE 0000000002 MAIN

50100-0000151127 g;g‘:r:mpmvememﬂ”m'& 1 1 msn”me Systems Group | ooy STATE 0000000013 MAIN

Road Improvements-Bristol &

50100-0000151127 Salem 1 1 Herao Enterprises Inc Vendor STATE 0000000034 MAIN

Road Improvements-Bristol &

50100-0000151127 Salem 1 1 KBS Inc Vendor STATE 0000036222 MAIN

£ Refresn

55 The Create Bidder Response page appears and the edit/change is complete.
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Bid Tab Cheat Sheet

The key to entering Bid Tab is understanding the sequence of events.
If the Event is Open, you will be able to enter Bidders.

If the Event is Posted and the clock is ticking, or the Event is Completed (prior to Pending Award), you
will be able to enter Bid Responses.

If the Clock is not ticking, where the Event End Date/Time has passed and the status changes to
Pending Award, you will need to create a New Version. (See the Jobaid on the Cardinal Website).

Or, the Event is Open (it is not Posted). You may enter the Bidders and set the End Date/Time to
something in the very near future. NOTE: Set the time providing just enough time to enter the bids! Save
and Post. The clock is now ticking!

The Following is taken from the Training UPK simulations in Cardinal and represents a simple bid
tabulation for 2 vendors already selected.

Step Action

1. Begin by navigating to the Create Bidder/Offeror Response page.

Click the Main Menu link.

Click the Sourcing link.

Point to the Event Responses menu.

Click the Create Bidder Response menu.
| Create Bidder Response |

The Business Unit field defaults for your agency (e.g., 50100 for VDOT).

Click in the Event ID field.

[ ]

7. Enter the Event ID that Cardinal assigned to it.

8. Click the Search button.
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Step Action
9. On the Create Bidder Response page, select the first displayed.
Click the hyperlink under the Event ID of that bidder’s row.
For Example:
[50100-00001507 67
10. Click the Enter a New Bid button.
| Enter a Mew Bid |
11. You may get a message to load the event quantities in the bidder’s response.
If so, click Yes. If No, you will have to enter each line quantity on your own.
12. The Event Details page displays.
Use the Event Details page to enter the bid you received.
13. If needed, click in the Your Bid Quantity field and enter the quantity bid on by this
bidder.
Your Bid Quantity I:I
14, Click in the Your Unit Bid Price field and enter the price bid by this bidder.
Your Unit Bid Price I:I
15. Click the Bid link to review / verify line details.
16. Review and verify the line details (e.g., quantity, price, etc.). When you have verified the
details, you can return to the Start Page and submit the bid.
For this scenario, the details are correct. Click the Start Page button.
Start Page
17. Click the Submit Bid button.
Submit Bid
18. Click the Yes button.
Yes
19. Click the OK button.
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Step Action
20. Clicking the OK button returns you to the Create Bidder Response page, where you can
enter another bidder response for this event. To enter a response for the next vendor,
click the hyperlink under the Event ID of that bidder’s row.
For Example:
501 00-0000150757]
21. Click the Enter a New Bid button.
| Enter a Mew Bid |
22. Click in the Your Bid Quantity field.
23. Enter the quantity bid by this bidder.
24, Click in the Your Unit Bid Price field.
25. Enter the price bid by this bidder.
26. Click the Bid link to review / verify line details.
27. Once you have reviewed and verified the information, you can return to the Start Page to
submit the bid.
Click the Start Page button.
Start Page
28. Click the Submit Bid button.
Submit Bid
29. Click the Yes button.
Yes
30. Click the OK button.
31. The Create Bidder Response page displays.
32. End of Procedure.
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